
 

 

CONCORDIA PARISH POLICE JURY 

REGULAR MEETING 

 JANUARY 23, 2023 

6:00 P.M. 

 
The Concordia Parish Police Jury met this day in regular session convened.  There were present the 

following members: 
            President    Collin Edwards 

 Vice President   Adam Probst 

Members  Gary Neal, Marie Yearby  

Scottie Whittington, Brad Adams, Maurice Bachus, 
Genesia Allen, Joseph Parker Sr. 

 Absent                           None 

 Secretary/Treasurer              Ariella Carter 
 Invocation    Joseph Parker Sr.  

 Pledge of Allegiance              Genesia Allen  

 

The meeting was called to order by Mr. Edwards.  Mrs. Carter conducted the roll and  
a Quorum was declared present. 

 

Upon a motion by Mr. Probst, duly seconded by Mr. Adams to approve the 
minutes of the January 23, 2023, regular meeting.  Motion carried unanimously. 

 

The Sealed Bids were opened next and the following bids were open and read:  

Gravel – C&M Earth Work LLC $24.50 price per ton/mile, distance is 35 miles, sand, clay gravel 

priced at $22.00 per ton.  

Gravel – APAC-MS $10.00 price per ton at 31 miles, coarse sand, clay gravel $12.00 per ton, Washed 

Maintenance Gravel $25.00 per ton, Washed Oversized Rock $28.00 per ton. 

Gravel –  Dozer, LLC, $0.49 per mile at 30 miles, sand, clay gravel $19.00 per ton.      

Gravel- Little River Services, $0.25 per mile approximately 46 miles, sand, clay gravel $20.00 per 

yard.  

Limestone – Dozer, LLC, $0.49 per mile at 18 miles, #7 $37.00 per ton, #57 $37.00 per ton, 610 Base 

$36.00 per ton, 4” $37.00 per ton, and R-200 $46.00 per ton.  

Limestone- Little River Services, $0.25 per mile, approximately 46 miles, #57 $39.00 per ton, 610 

Base $38.00 per ton, 2” oversized $39.75 per ton, and 4” $39.75 per ton. 

Limestone -Terral River Service, $0.27 per mile, 20 miles, #7 $36.00 per ton #8 $36.00 per ton, #57 
$34.00 per ton, 610 Base $33.00 per ton, 2” oversized $34.00 per ton, 4” $35.00 per ton, R-200 $39.00 

per ton.  

Fuel – McCartney Oil, No. 2 Bulk Highway Diesel (clear ultra-low sulfur & up to 5% Maximum Bio 

Blends) $0.12 over Natchez Terminal (Placid). No.2 Bulk Off-road Diesel (dyed ultra-low sulfur & up 

to 5% Maximum Bio Blends) $0.12 over Natchez Terminal (Placid). Minimum 87 Octane 
Conventional Gasoline for Highway use (No Ethanol) $0.12 over Natchez Terminal (Placid) 

Fuel – Scott Petroleum, No. 2 Bulk Highway Diesel (clear ultra-low sulfur & up to 5% maximum bio 

blends) $0.58. No. 2 Bulk Off-road Diesel (dyed ultra-low sulfur & up to 5% maximum bio blends) 

$0.58. Minimum 87 Octane Conventional Gasoline for Highway use (No Ethanol) $0.58. 

Fuel – Kaiser Petroleum, No. 2 Bulk Highway Diesel (clear ultra-low sulfur & up to 5% Maximum 

Bio Blends) $0.07 cents over rack. No. 2 Bulk Off-road Diesel (dyed ultra-low sulfur & up to 5% 



Maximum bio blends) $0.07 cents over rack. Minimum 87 Octane Conventional Gasoline for 
Highway use (No Ethanol) $0.07 cents over rack.  

Lubrication Fluids – McCartney Oil, Citgo 600 15w-40, $790.93,  Citgo 600 15w-40 $790.93. Citgo 

600 SAE30 $773.06. Citgo 700 10w-30 syn blend $1261.88, 55-gallon drum Diesel Exhaust Fluid 

(DEF) $185.00, per price on Bulk Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) $2.37, Citgo Transgard HD 

Transmission $1093.75, Citgo Transgard Tractor Hydraulic $12.85. 

Lubrication Fluids -  Scott Petroleum, 55 gallon drum engine oil Chevron Delo 400 SDE15w-40 

$740.55, 55 gallon drum engine oil Shell Rotella-T 15w-40 $820.00, 55 gallon drum diesel engine oil 
SAE 30w $616.25, 55 gallon drum Chevron Delo 400 XLE 10w-30 $689.95, 55 gallon drum Diesel 

Exhaust Fluid (DEF) $179.99, Per gallon price on Bulk Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) $1.85, 55 gallon 

drum Transmission/Drive Train SAE 30w (TO-4 spec) $677.85, Per gallon price on Bulk hydraulic 

fluid SAE 30w i.e. Chevron THF $11.42. 

Chemicals – Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC, Round Up Pro Concentrate +/- 300gl $34.00/gal, 
Roundup Custom +/- 300gl $40.00/gal, Generic Glyphosate +/- 300gl $32.00/gal, Oust XP +/- 24lb 

$30.00/lb, Surfactant +/- 300gl $18.48/gal. 

Culverts – Coastal Culvert & Supply, Inc submitted the following:  

SIZE  GAUGE  GALVANIZED ASPHAULT 

& COATED 

ASPHAULT 

COATED 

PAVED INVERT  

15"  16 $26.87 $32.57 $44.16 

18"  16 $33.58 $41.19 $56.65 

21” 16 $38.06 $46.62 $64.01 

24” 16 $42.54 $52.04 $71.38 

24” 14 $53.76 $63.20 $82.52 

30” 16 $53.80 $66.10 $91.23 

30” 14 $67.16 $79.48 $104.61 

36” 16 $64.93 $78.22 $105.28 

36” 14 $80.60 $93.83 $120.89 

42” 16 $87.54 $107.68 $133.61 

42” 14 $108.13 $123.2 $154.13 

48” 16 $102.09 $121.04 $159.70 

48” 14 $128.96 $147.81 $186.47 

54” 14 $145.07 $170.05 $221.08 

60” 12 $217.61 $243.48 $296.84 

66” 10 $316.23 $342.89 $398.55 

72” 10 $344.22 $375.42 $440.37 

78” 8 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  

84” 8 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  

PRICES FOR CORRUGATED STEEL ARCH PIPE  
18”X11” 16 $35.87 $36.58 $48.18 

22”X 13” 16 $38.62 $46.21 $61.67 

25”X16” 16 $43.77 $52.30 $61.67 

29”X18” 14 $61.79 $74.13 $90.56 

36”X22” 14 $77.24 $89.52 $114.65 

43”X27” 12 $92.69 $105.87 $132.94 

58”X36” 12 $200.82 $219.45 $258.07 

65”X40” 12 $225.53 $250.21 $301.24 

72”X44” 10 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  

79”X49” 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid  

 



 
  

Upon a motion by Ms. Allen, duly seconded by Mr. Neal to approve a resolution ordering and calling 

a special election for the Fire Protection District No.2. Motion carried unanimously.  

 
Upon a motion by Mr. Probst, duly seconded by Mr. Whittington approving the reappointment of 

Mr. Harvey Cowan and Mr. Virgil Barnes to the Concordia Parish Fire District #2 Board of 

Commissioners. Motion carried unanimously. 
 

Upon a motion by Mr. Probst, duly seconded by Mr. Bachus to approve the appointment of Mr. 

Ronnie Wilkerson as a member of the Concordia Parish Sewer Board District #1. Motion carried 

unanimously.  
 

Jurors brought forward the following Ordinance Violations:  

Mr. Parker- 466 Lower Levee Rd is being used a dumping site.  
Interim Secretary/Treasurer Cathy Darden- Mr. Henry Fitt is putting up one (1) bedroom sheds on 

National Guard Rd. A motion was made by Mr. Probst, duly seconded by Mrs. Allen to cite the 

above violations. Motion carried unanimously.  

 
A motion was made by Mr. Parker, duly seconded by Ms. Allen to authorize Mr. Larry Walters with 

LDH to send a letter to Mr. Fitt in reference to the one (1) bedroom sheds on National Guard Rd.  

 
Under Project/Grant Updates Interim Secretary/Treasurer Cathy Darden provided the following 

updates: FEMA paved roads extensions have been granted. Mrs. Darden and Mrs. Carter received 

notice that the Parish is eligible for a 256K grant in which will be applied for. Mr. Lee with Capital 

Outlay would not allow is to declare the chiller an emergency. Mrs. Darden is in the process of 
looking for a mechanical engineer to begin on the chiller project. Mrs. Darden is going to check with 

Rostan on the next step for Brushy Bayou.   

 
The following updates were provided for Superintendent’s Work Orders:  

The mobile home on Rabb Rd. must be moved onto the respective lot. 

Culverts- 24”x30’ – JJ Pruitt, 24”x42’ oval JJ Pruitt, 15”x30’ Gore Rd., 48”x50’ Black Bayou Rd.  

610(yards) – 15yds on Pete Davis, 15yds on Luke Martin, 30yds on Haphazard Rd., 15yds on Ron 
Rd., 15yds on Belle Grove Circle, 15yds on Doty Rd., 15yds on Nichols Rd., 15yds, on National 

Guard Rd., and 45yds on Bob Rife Rd.  

Maintenance Gravel (yards) – 40yds on Minorca, 15yds on James King, and 45yds on Centennial.  
A motion was made by Mr. Probst, duly seconded by Ms. Allen to approve the materials. Motion 

carried unanimously.    

 

Work Orders from the Jurors were next brought forward. A motion was made by Mr. Probst, duly 
seconded by Ms. Allen to approve the following:  

Whittington – Rokafee Rd needs maintenance gravel and Forrest Rd. needs gravel/pit run.  

Neal – Vidalia Drive on Robert Webber needs guard rails on the sides.  
 

Upon a motion made by Ms. Allen, duly seconded by Mr. Probst to adjourn the meeting. Motion 

caried unanimously.  

 
 

 

 
 



CERTIFICATE 

 I, Ariella Carter, Secretary/Treasurer of the Concordia Parish Police  
Jury do hereby certify that the above and foregoing is a true and correct copy of the 

minutes of the Concordia Parish Police Jury at which a quorum was present and  

participating on the 23rd day of January 2023, in Vidalia, Louisiana. 

 
______________________________________ 

Ariella Carter, Secretary/Treasurer  


